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oo . . Super Co-Op Market Basket RFP #1702
Central Unified School District

RFP#1819-06 - Distribution of USDA Foods and Commerical Food Products
Proposal Worksheet

Instructlo'ns. Indicate Dellverec.i Cost per. ¢.:ase. in yellow highlighted columns for each item or group.indicate GOLD STAR GS-total SYSCO SYS-TOTAL
whether item meets Buy American Provision in marked columns.
Commodity Item Estimated

Manufacturer Line No. Item Description Manufacturer Code Pack Quantity
Super Co-Op Items
Advance Pierre 1 Beef, ribbg-honey BBQ grld 3716 100/3.25 434 0 25.84 11214.56 31.22 13549.48
Advance Pierre 2 Beef, meatballs 1-17-505-0 960/.5 oz 275 0 21.99 6047.25 21.26 5846.5
Advance Pierre 3 Beef, Patty-grilled smoky 9617 100/3 oz 983 0 22.66 22274.78 50.74 49877.42
Advance Pierre 4 Wafer, PB& grape jelly graham A1290 160/2.3 oz 1092 62.22 67944.24 59.07 64504.44
Advance Pierre 5 Beef, Taco filling 32432-328 6/5# 243 38.49 9353.07 40.28 9788.04
Advance Pierre 6 Beef, Cheeseburgers-mini twin WG 1171 96/4.7 oz 366 58.92 21564.72 55.85 1488.24
Ardellas 7 Pizza, longbrd cheese flbrd IW 90410 80/5 oz 26 48.35 1257.1 57.24 1488.24
Ardellas 8 Pizza, longbrd pepperoni flbrd IW 90406 80/5 oz 49 50.92 2495.08 54.47 2669.03
Ardellas 9 Pizzarito, pepperoni IW 80149 54/5.25 oz 85 35.36 3005.6 38.02 3231.7
Ardellas 10 Pizza, round 5" pepperoni 90146 60/5.37 30 52.33 1569.9 54.5 1635
Ardellas 11 Pizza, round 5" cheese 90148 60/5.37 30 51.15 1534.5 53.22 1596.6
Arizona Gold 12 Burrito, bean and Cheese trad WG IW 3100330W 54/3.3 oz 652 28.3 18451.6 3491 22761.32
Arizona Gold 13 Burrito, bean and cheese trad WG IW 3100575W 54/5.75 oz 750 30.1 22575 33.47 25102.5
Arizona Gold 14 Burrito, bean and cheese trad bulk 3100575B 54/5.75 oz 550 27.43 15086.5 30.56 16808
Beacon Street 15 Breadstick, cheese stuffd-51% WG 73338 200/2.1 0z 1100 36.52 40172 40.79 44869
Big Daddy 16 Pizza-primo 16" cheese pre-sl WG 78653 72/5.18 oz 220 50.93 11204.6 53.77 11829.4
Big Daddy 17 Pizza, primo 16" pepprni pre-sl WG 78654 72/5.18 oz 515 56.46 29076.9 61.84 31847.6
Big Daddy 18 Pizza, primo 16" buffalo chicken WG 78639 72/5.21 106 52.68 5584.08 56.94 6035.64
Big Daddy 19 Pizza, primo 16" 4 meat WG 78640 72/5.3 oz 100 54.1 5410 58.39 5839
Boscos 20 Breadstick, mozzarella RF-7" WG 702110-1120 108 225 36.15 8133.75 35.96 8091
Boscos 21 Breadstick, pepprni-mozz 7" stfd pza 702372-1120 72 1171 34.21 40059.91 35.57 41652.47
Brookwood Farms 22 Western Pork BBQ LS Texas 1230 4/5# 50 36.75 1837.5 90.65 4532.5
Cargill Meat 23 Turkey, breast oven roasted sliced 700269 120/1.8 oz 75 77.45 5808.75 88.15 6611.25
Coyote Grill 24 Quesadilla, chicken & cheese 51% WG 78373 96/4.4 oz 857 54.21 46457.97 59.12 50665.84
Don Lee Farms 25 Cheeseburger, classic IW QCB475 75/4.2 oz 75 53.84 4038 54.98 4123.5
Don Lee Farms 26 Patty, veggie farmers mkt blend 769471FS 80/3 oz 134 no bid 59.3 no bid no bid 0
Don Lee Farms 27 Corn Dog, chicken-jumbo IW CN34072WWG 72/4 oz 98 no bid 35.45 no bid no bid 0
Don Lee Farms 28 Burger, classic IW QHBA425 75/4.25 oz 15 45.54 683.1 47.85 717.75
Don Lee Farms 29 Sausage link, pork CNQ701253P 384/1.25 oz 86 45.18 3885.48 47.46 4081.56
Don Lee Farms 30 Pancake, pork sausage on a stick CNQ71303P 160/3 oz 232 50.51 11718.32 52.59 12200.88
Don Lee Farms 31 Beef, teriyaki slam dunkers CNQTDO0753 160/3 oz 483 52.65 25429.95 54.71 26424.93
Ferrnandos 32 Burrito, bean & cheese- zesty fiesta IW  |5817 96/5 oz 113 57.27 6471.51 60.04 6784.52
Integrated 33 Beef, taco stick IW C45019 50/4.6 oz 108 36.85 3979.8 40.21 4342.68
Integrated 34 Sandwich, grilled cheese spicy IW 704001 72/4.29 oz 20 42.18 843.6 45.84 916.8
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Integrated 35 Hot Dog, chili cheese low sodium RF IW (952000 72/4.5 oz 86 49.07 4220.02 53.76 4623.36
Integrated 36 Sandwich, grilled cheese WG IW C10800 72/4.19 oz 765 37.93 29016.45 42.39 32428.35
Integrated 37 Bun, Hawaiian - trky ham & cheese IW 130018 100/3.4 oz 312 53.48 16685.76 58.83 18354.96
Integrated 38 Chalupa, Bean & Cheese IW C82751 72/3.8 0z 85 50.87 4323.95 51.72 4396.2
Integrated 39 Quesadilla, grld cheese twice IW C36200 100/4.11 oz 29 57.82 1676.78 63 1827
Jennie O 40 Bacon, trky pre-cookied 2711-06 12/50 ct 72 78.48 5650.56 80.59 5802.48
Jennie O 41 Ham, trky extra lean sliced 2565 12/1# 20 27.34 546.8 26.81 536.2
Jennie O 42 Bacon bits, trky-pre-cooked 8716-02 12/1/1.5# 69 138.17 9533.73 147.72 10192.68
JTM 43 Beef, Spaghetti sauce-RF CP5578 6/5# 100 28.74 2874 28.25 2825
JTM 44 Beef, Spaghetti sauce CP5590 6/5# 455 34.08 15506.4 33.24 15124.2
Land O Lakes 45 Cheese, pepper jack slices 44238 8/1.54 20 19.17 383.4 18.27 365.4
Land O Lakes 46 Cheese, mozzarella - It string 59703 168/1 oz 1349 15.4 20774.6 14.75 19897.75
Land O Lakes 47 Cheese, American sliced 160 46255 4/5# pch 257 20.9 5371.3 23.84 6126.88
Land O Lakes 48 Cheese, mozzarella-shred 41698 4/5#pch 40 12.45 498 13.64 545.6
Land O Lakes 49 Macaroni & cheese RF 43277 6/5# 883 44.6 39381.8 46.28 40865.24
Land O Lakes 50 Cheese, cheddar mild-shred 41749 4/5# 215 12.65 2719.75 13.86 2979.9
Land O Lakes 51 Cups, cheese mucho queso jalapeno 39912 140/3 oz 269 54.62 14692.78 58.36 15698.84
Land O Lakes 52 Cheese, colby jack - sticks IW RF 44878 168/1 oz 612 21.28 13023.36 21.14 12937.68
Land O Lakes 53 Cups, cheese cheddar ULT dip 39911 140/3 oz 75 54.62 4096.5 58.36 4377
Land O Lakes 54 Cheese, cheddar mild-sticks IW 44879 168/1 oz 320 17.97 5750.4 17.55 5616
Los Cabos 55 Burrito, chili cheese - macho WG IW 71667 96/5.2 oz 103 67.87 6990.61 75.42 7768.26
Mc Cain 56 Potatoes, smile shaped OIF03456 6/4# 200 23.52 4704 23.04 4608
Mc Cain 57 Potatoes, skn on, spirals spicy MCL03622 6/4# 1546 18.84 29126.64 17.83 27565.18
Mc Cain 58 Potatoes, Fry - straight cut-seasn 3/8": MCLX03621 6/5# 32 19.56 625.92 19.06 609.92
Mc Cain 59 Potatoes, Fry-extreme gusto garlic MXF269 6/5# 1306 24.06 31422.36 23.92 31239.52
Michael B's 60 Burrito, bean and cheesse w/grn chili BCB500 80/50z 30 52.03 1560.9 52.96 1588.8
Michael B's 61 Flaguito, chili cheese FT020 80/5.16 oz 100 71.42 7142 74.78 7478
Michael B's 62 Taquitos, chicken WG bulk CTB43 100/2.258 oz 309 no bid 48.97 15131.73 no bid 0
Old Town Bakery 63 Rolls, cinnamon NOI WG IW CIN3.5 72/3.5 oz 202 34.81 7031.62 36.19 7310.38
Ore-lda 64 Potatoes, Triangle hash brwn OIFO0049A 6/5# 89 28.33 2521.37 no bid 0
Ore-lda 65 Potatoes, fries 1/2# crinkle cut oven rdy |OIFO0055A 6/5# 800 15.66 12528 14.82 11856
Ore-lda 66 Potatoes, Tater tots-plain OIF00215A 6/5# 252 18.06 no bid 0
Red Gold 67 Marinara sauce cups REDNA1Z 250/10z 1107 27.53 30475.71 27.88 30863.16
Red Gold 68 Marinara sauce cups REDNA27C84 84/2.5 oz 350 24.65 8627.5 24.22 8477
Red Gold 69 Marinara sauce, canned RPKNA99 6/#10 188 26.06 4899.28 32.65 6138.2
Red Gold 70 Tomatoes, diced in juice canned RPKBQ99 6/#10 34 24.5 833 no bid 0
Red Gold 71 BBQ sauce, dunk cups 250/1 oz 458 26.12 11962.96 26.52 12146.16
Redstn Canyon 72 Potatoes, Fries seasoned trax MCL03623 6/4.5# 1617 21.24 34345.08 20.7 33471.9
Rose & Shore 73 Sandwich, sub turkey deli & cheese IW  |TDC336WC 36/5.15 oz 300 28.92 8676 31.57 9471
Rose & Shore 74 Quesadilla, cheese WG IW W31100 48/4.3 oz 195 30.85 6015.75 33.5 6532.5
Rose & Shore 75 Turkey, roasted w/gravy 782 4/5# 450 355 15975 39.23 17653.5
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Simplot 76 Potatoes, crinkle tater pals 6/5# 49 13.66 669.34 12.78 626.22
Smuckers 77 Uncrustable, PB&Grape Jelly Lrg WG 5150021027 72/5.3 oz 613 59.95 36749.35 62.27 38171.51
Smuckers 78 Uncrustable, PB&Straw jelly Irf WG 5150021028 72/5.3 oz 564 60.86 34325.04 63.45 35785.8
Sunny Fresh 79 Eggs, hard cooked, pillow pack 50038 8/18 ct 15 29.78 0
Sunny Fresh 80 Eggs, pre-cooked scrambled 40827 4/54# 283 26.54 0
Sunny Fresh 81 French toast, cinnamon glazed WG 40034 100/2.9 oz 115 47.81 5498.15 no bid 0
ALTERNATE ITEM 81.1 FRENCH TOAST WG CINN GLZED IW 40091 110/2.9 0Z 115 0 0 57.23 6581.45
Sunwise Foods 82 Sandwich, sunflwr butter & grape jly 12228 96/2.8 0z 150 53.18 7977 54.52 8178
Tasty Brands 83 Tacos, chicken mini flour WG 25701 297/1.5 oz 75 58.14 4360.5 63.07 4730.25
The Max 84 Maxsnayx, taco-totally WG 77387-12714 96/4.09 oz 360 44.09 15872.4 43.97 15829.2
The Max 85 Max wraps, chili cheese WG 77387-12646 90/4.8 oz 38 33.51 1273.38 32.43 1232.34
The Max 86 Maxsnax, conqueso WG 77387-12658 96/4.2 oz 160 44.42 7107.2 44.44 7110.4
Tony's 87 Pizza, 4x6 pepperoni, smart 100% WG 78698 96/4.48 oz 448 31.79 14241.92 35.67 15980.16
Tony's 88 Pizza, 4x6 cheese, smart 100% WG 78697 96/4.5 oz 277 28.5 7894.5 32.35 8960.95
Tony's 89 Pizza, breakfast trky sausage, WG 63912 128/3.31 0z 672 38.44 25831.68 42.21 28365.12
Tony's 90 Pizza, French bread cheese 6" WG 78356 60/5.2 oz 228 37.06 8449.68 39.69 9049.32
Tony's 91 Pizza, French bread-pepperoni 6" WG 78357 60/5.2 oz 350 40.77 14269.5 42.08 14728
Tonys 92 Pizza, cheese 4" rnd galaxy WG IW 78366 72/4.56 oz 203 38 7714 41.43 8410.29
Tony's 93 Pizza, pepperoni 4" rnd galaxy WG IW 78367 72/4.56 366 38.56 14112.96 41.42 15159.72
Tyson 94 Chicken patties spicy wg brd 005567-0928 148/3.26 oz 187 42.1 7872.7 43.55 8143.85
Tyson 95 Chicken, fajita 003522-0928 8/4.99# 88 77.81 6847.28 84.56 7441.28
Tyson 96 Chicken, patty krispy krunchy 003857-0928 140/3.53 880 39.66 34900.8 40.31 35472.8
Tyson 97 Chicken, filets-FC grld breasts 038350-0928 54/3 oz 1062 31.15 33081.3 30.46 32348.52
Tyson 98 Chicken, drumsticks dk WG 666010-0928 108/4.4 oz 908 59.08 53644.64 61.77 56087.16
Tyson 99 Chicken, tenders-krispy krunchy 003859-0928 31.86# 2329 39.63 92298.27 40.31 93881.99
Tyson 100 Chicken, tenders, spicy 070344-0928 152 41.23 6266.96 41.69 6336.88
Tyson 101 Chicken, rings crispy WG 070366-0928 6/5.8075 60 4471 2682.6 46.72 2803.2
Yangs 102 Chicken, mandarin orange 100% WG 8-52724-15552-4 6/5# 862 107.01 92242.62 119.5 103009
Yangs 103 Chicken, lemongrass, WG 8-52724-1553-1 6/5# 150 107.46 16119 119.99 17998.5
Yangs 104 Chicken, teriyaki BBQ 100% WG 8-52724-15554-8 6/5# 209 92.53 19338.77 104 21736
Yangs 105 Chicken, sweet Thai chili WG 8-52724-15550-0 6/5# 117 107.46 12572.82 119.99 14038.83
Yangs 106 Chicken, Edamame Kung Pao 8-52724-15557-9 6/5# 100 113.33 11333 124.07 12407
Yangs 107 Chicken, Curry 8-52724-15567-8 6/#5 75 92.53 6939.75 104.08 7806
1494978 1560620.77
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